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“Success is not 
the key to 
happiness.  

 
Happiness is the 
key to success.  

 
If you love what 
you are doing, 

you will be 
successful.” 

 
- Herman Cain 

 

 

 

Dear Parents and Well Wishers 

It is with great pleasure we welcome you and your 
children to a new school year.  

 
 “Education is not the filling of a pail, but the lighting 
of a fire” –William Butler Yeats, (Poet, 1865-1939). 

 
Happiness is just as important for a long life as a 
healthy diet and lifestyle. In a world of stress and 
immense competition we often ask the question- 
“how do we find happiness”. The answer to this 
ambiguous question is one simple answer - happiness 
comes from doing what we love and loving what we 
do. We believe that happiness and wellbeing should 
be at the heart of education. 
 
As a catalyst of happiness, we seek to develop and 
teach our children the skills of happiness and how to 
flourish in and out of school. We aim to nurture the 
different facets of a child besides academic 
programmes. The school encourages all students to 
participate in a variety of co-curricular activities from 
dance, art and drama to a variety of sports to social 
work to environmental conservation activities. It is 
important for a child to explore and find their 
strengths in order to reach their true potential as a 
self-confident individual. 
 
We, just like you, believe in holistic education for 
your child, encompassing – academics, co-curricular 
activities, sports education and life-skills learning. Our 
endeavor is to strike a balance between state-of-the-
art infrastructure and an internationally acceptable 
education. We look forward to give the students 
every opportunity to succeed and celebrate with you 
their achievements. My wishes to all for a memorable 
and significant academic year ahead.  
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Annika 
Agarwal 

Zonal 
Rank – 3 

International 
Rank – 7 

Zawar 
Palash 

Zonal 
Rank – 9 

International 
Rank – 9 

Zawar 
Arnav 

Zonal 
Rank – 23 

International 
Rank – 24 

Dhruv 
Katta 

Zonal 
Rank – 22 

International 
Rank – 23 

HIGHLIGHTS OF THE MONTH  

School Of India extends hearty congratulations on their exceptional performance and 

wishes them all the best for many more laurels in their life. 

 

Environment Day 

Badminton Champion, 

Akil is ranked 10th in 

Karnataka state ranking 

in Under-15 category.  

Level II – English Olympiad Results  

Distinction holders of 

Cambridge English exams. 
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With Warm Regards 

Tasbia Khan 

Director 

School Of India 

Kindergarten 

Yoga Day 

World Music Day 


